
 

233 South 13th Street 

Suite 1100 

Lincoln, NE 68508 

 

 

www.GarverUSA.com   

  
November 7, 2024 

Grand Junction Regional Airport 
Attn: Mrs. Angela Padalecki 
2828 Walker Field Drive 
Grand Junction, CO 81506 
 
Re: Grand Junction Regional Airport 
 Aircraft Rescue and Fire Fighting (ARFF) Vehicle  
 Recommendation of Award 
 
Dear Mrs. Padalecki: 
 
Bids were received for the “Aircraft Rescue and Fire Fighting (ARFF) Vehicle" project at the Grand 
Junction Regional Airport at 2:00 p.m. on November 5, 2024.  The bids have been checked for accuracy 
and for compliance with the contract documents.  A tabulation of the bids is enclosed with this letter. 
 
One bid was received by Oshkosh Airport Products. Refer to the table below for a summary of the bid 
amounts and the Engineer’s Estimate. 
 
  

 
Description 

Engineer’s Estimate Oshkosh Airport 
Products 

Schedule 1 

Base Bid – 3,000 gal ARFF Vehicle, 
Class 5 

$1,600,000.00 $1,215,559.00 

Add Alt 1 – Extended Bumper to 
Bumber Warranty – 3 Years 

--- $23,445.00 

Add Alt 2 – Extended Bumper to 
Bumber Warranty – 2 Years 

--- $9,964.00 

Add Alt 3 – Standard Maintenance 
Contract – 2 Years 

--- No Bid 

Add Alt 4 – Standard Maintenance 
Contract – 1 Year 

--- No Bid 

Schedule 2 

Base Bid – 1,5000 gal ARFF 
Vehicle, Class 4 

$1,400,000.00 $1,126,573.00 

Add Alt 1 – Extended Bumper to 
Bumber Warranty – 3 Years 

--- $21,865.00 

Add Alt 2 – Extended Bumper to 
Bumber Warranty – 2 Years 

--- $9,293.00 

Add Alt 3 – Standard Maintenance 
Contract – 2 Years 

--- No Bid 

Add Alt 4 – Standard Maintenance 
Contract – 1 Year 

--- No Bid 
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As part of the design and bid process, Garver directly coordinated with three providers of ARFF vehicles 

including Oshkosh, Rosenbauer, and E-One. The project advertisement was sent directly to all three 

providers, publicly advertised, and hosted on BidNet.   

Oshkosh included one exception in their bid. Where the specification requires one water-foam booster 
reel (SS-705-3.6.6.1) and one dry agent hose reel (SS-705-3.7.2), the exception provides for a dual 
agent hose reel and handline.  
 
The bid was evaluated for completeness and correctness in accordance with the bid instructions. The 
bidder was found to be responsive and responsible.  
 
We believe that the bid submitted by Oshkosh Airport Products meets the requirements of the bid 
documents and represents a good value for the Grand Junction Regional Airport. We recommend that 
a construction contract for the 3,000-gal ARFF Vehicle, Class 5 for a total of $1,215,559.00 be awarded 
to Oshkosh Airport Products.  
 
Please call me if you have any questions.   
 
Sincerely, 
 
GARVER, LLC 
 
 
 
Roger Knobeloch, P.E. 
Project Manger 

 
Attachments:  Bid Tabulation 



 

GJT ARFF Vehicle Acquisition 

Grand Junction Regional Airport 

Grand Junction, CO 

Nov. 5, 2024; 2:30PM 

 

BID RESULTS SHEET 
 

Bidder  
Schedule # / 

Base Bid 
 

Add 1 –  
3 Year 

Extended 
Warranty 

 
Add 2 –  
2 Year 

Extended 
Warranty 

 
Add 3 –  
2 Year 

Maintenance 
Contract 

 
Add 4 –  
1 Year 

Maintenance 
Contract 

 
 
 

Garver Project No. 2400849 
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Engineer’s Estimate  1 - $1,600,00.00  ---  ---  ---  --- 

  2 - $1,400,000.00  ---  ---  ---  --- 

           

Oshkosh Airport Products  1 - $1,215,559.00  $23,445.00  $9,964.00  No Bid  No Bid 

1515 County Road O, Suite A  2 - $1,126,573.00  $21,865.00  $9,293.00  No Bid  No Bid 

Neenah, WI 54956           

           

           

           

 

 

  


